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Carole R.
Where am I going?

2242 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  11:09:01  

...Just my imagination runnin away with me...

Your'e having a Dusty themed party.

Music -wise.. You have to pick a Dusty song to 'welcome' everyone in
to your home.

You also need to pick a Dusty song to throw/get everyone out of
your home, at some unearthly hour.

So, just TWO Dusty songs required, please.

Carole R xx

Mark
I’ve got a good thing

United Kingdom
5309 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  11:17:25  

Maybe 'Look of love' to welcome people as it's a very 'relaxing' song
and will put people at their ease, hopefully

Harder to think of one that would make people want to leave, maybe
'Your hurtin' kind of love' as it's a jumpy, bit all over the place song and
not a relaxing one at all

Mark

Tim
Where am I going?

United Kingdom
3422 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  11:38:28    

I would start with an ambient mix (which I havenn't done yet) of
something floaty - Sea & Sky maybe...and then crank it up...... I would
finish with Dusty saying goodnight - sampled from one of her BBC
shows. Then the breaking crocks from the end of 'Dusty Definitely'.

I often finish my real parties with 'I Had a Talk With My Man Last Night'
as it's one of my favourites - by then I'm probably too 'relaxed' to play
conscientious host anymore ..LOL

'You talkin' about me?'

mssdusty
I’ve got a good thing

USA
5821 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  14:13:17    

I START PARTY WITH

I ONLY WANT TO BE WITH YOU!!!http://www.youtube.com/watch?
v=pr9Ur03A55U

END WITH YDHTSYLM.........
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=sotRQXqfz9Y
http://www.youtube.com/view_play_list?
p=16A659D846089D2B&playnext=1&playnext_from=PL&v=pPeRiP7V_3c
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M ..............END OF PARTY

THE LOOK OF LOVE IS IN YOUR EYES! 
Watch my video with Dusty on YouTube!

Edited by - mssdusty on 29/05/2009 16:51:40

Berthavenation
I’ll try anything

Netherlands
1593 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  15:26:23  

Hm.. for starters I'd use "Welcome home", "Knowing when to leave"
should be an adequate reminder of that ungodly hour....

Frans

hedydust
Little by little

USA
736 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  15:37:05      

I would start with Stay Awhile 

http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=RRRLrDnx5OY

End with Learn To Say Goodbye
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=Bwm1HJlI0BE 

***All I See Is You***

Edited by - Tim on 29/05/2009 16:25:51

dancer8595
Little by little

United Kingdom
690 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  17:12:42  

Oooh...I like this thread.

On arrival: 

Live It Up

Lots of good 'leaving' ones though aren't there?

Home To Myself
It's Over (although I wouldn't want everyone to actually be in tears at
the end)
Goodbye
Packin' Up

and, if anyone gets lucky:

Will You Love Me Tomorrow

For those who get slightly over-enthusiastic on the vodka and
champagne, and can't quite remember how to get home:

Where Am I Going?

Rosie x

"she's a sweetheart except when she's moody/it's hard to get through
to her then..."
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memphisinlondon
Where am I going?

United Kingdom
3565 Posts

Posted - 29/05/2009 :  19:08:13  

On arrival :

Live It Up or What's It Gonna Be with the bass box cranked up.

Departure time:

I'd Rather Leave While I'm In Love

Memphis
Ever since we met...

paula
Moderator

USA
5012 Posts

Posted - 30/05/2009 :  05:30:24  

welcome to my party, "I want To Make You Happy Tonight"

and as you leave..so many.. but maybe "Daydreaming" and I'll go along
with Tim & throw in some "breaking crockery"

paula x

Laura
Administrator

United Kingdom
3075 Posts

Posted - 30/05/2009 :  11:20:18      

hmmm good thread!

My arrival choice would be: Welcome home

Departure would be: Goodbye

Oh.. my party is starting to sound like an airport lounge 

Of course these are very soft and gentle songs so I would liven things
up in between.

Love, Laura xx

Let's Shop Dusty!
http://astore.amazon.co.uk/letadu-21
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